The Milan Town Board held their Regular Town Board meeting on 09/18/2017 at 7:00
PM at the Milan Town Hall.

Present: Supervisor William Gallagher
Councilperson Jack Campisi, Charles Godfrey, Marion Mathison, Douglas
Raelson

Supervisor opened the meeting with the Pledge of Allegiance.
HIGHWAY BIDS 2018
The Clerk opened the following bids:

Red Wing Properties
PO Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582

Callanan Industries, Inc.
PO Box 15097
Albany, NY 12212

Amenia Sand & Gravel
PO Box 15097
Albany, NY 12212

Rock City Sand and Gravel
820 Route 199
Milan, NY 12571

Peckham Material Corp.
PO Box 651
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569

A Colarusso & Son, Inc.
PO Box 32
Hudson, NY 12434



PROPOSAL AND BID FORM

Pursuant to your request and in compliance with “Information for Bidders”, dated ﬁf’ ':?.4_7{ 2047 the
undersigned hereby offers to furnish Crushed Stone which will meet the requirements as specified in the Specifications of
the New York State Department of Public Works, dated January 2, 1962, R.O.B. Gravel, Washed Gravel, and Washed Sand
will be clean and well graded; subject to the approval of the Town Superintendent of Highways.

Prices are to be submitted per ton and/or per cubic yard f.o.b. bidder’s plant and stockpiled within the Town of
My f& n . These prices are for the year 20 | 3’ .

Length of haul, quality and availability of product will be considered in awarding this business and the
superintendent has the right to reject any and all bids,
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< CALLANAN

INDUSTRIES, INC.

‘BUILDING NEW YORK'S INFRASTRUCTURE SINCE 1883°

September 14, 2017

Catherine Gill, Town Clerk

Town of Milan, Memorial Town Hall
20 Wilcox Circle

Milan, NY 12571

Dear Madam:

Pursuant to your notice to bidders, we are pleased to quote the following prices for 2018,

Item FOB Plant Per Ton Delivered
Type 1 Base —1%" $ 51.00 No Bid
Type 3 Binder — 3" $ 52.00 ~ NoBid
Type 6 Top — %" $ 57.00 Mo Bid
Type 7 Top = %’ 3 59.00 No Bid
12.5mm $ 58.00 No Bid
' 9.5mm $ 60.00 1 'No Bid
| Type 5 Shim $ 75.00 No Bid
| Winter Mix - QPR _ $105.00 $110.60 |
ALL HMA PRICES WILL BE ADJUSTMENT BASED
ADJUSTED MONTHLY - 917 @ $420.00 UPON NYSDOT INDEX_ |
1A = YW -washed $21.00 $26.80 :
#1 — 1%"-washed $11.25 $16.85
1 & 2 Blend - 5/8"-washed $11.25  $16.50
#2 Stone- 3/4" N $10.90 $16.50
#3 Stone $10.80 $16.50
ltem 4 — Crusher Run — 1" Minus | § 9.40 $15.00 |
ltem 4 — Crusher Run - 2" Minus | § 910 514.70 4
Select Fill i 3 8.50 514.50
lce Control Sand . §11.50 $17.10
Light Stone Fill_ §12.50 3 $1760 |
! Medium Stene Fill 51450 | NoBid
| Heavy Sione Fill $15.50 ’ No Bid =
_Washed Ice Control Sand | NoBid $15.50 _| S Bethlehem

All materials available at East Kingsten facility unless otherwise noted. Terms: Net 30 Days.
Thank you for the opportunity of presenting this quotation,
Sincerely,

CALLAR ES, INC.

Timothy :
Sales Manager
Bids’ 7018 Mijan, 170 MATERIALS * CONSTRUCTION

Post Office Box 15097 = Albany, New York 12212-5097 « (518} 374-2222 » Fax {518) 374-1721



Corporata Office: P.O. Box 15097
Albany, NY 12212-5097
Ph: (518) 381-9836 Fax: (518) 374-1721

Plant Location: P.O. Box CI
AAMENNNS Aments, NY 12501

SAND & GRAVEL Ph: (845) 373-8151 Fax: (845) 373-8015

September 14, 2017

Catherine Gill, Town Clerk
Town of Milan

Memorial Town Hall

20 Wilcox Circle

Milan, NY 12571

Dear Madam:

Pursuant to your notice to bidders, we are pleased to quote the following prices for 2018.

Itern FOB Plant Per Ton | Delivered
Type 1 Base — 1% $ 51.00 No Bid
Type 3 Binder — 34" $ 52.00 No Bid
Type 6 Top - %' $57.00 | No Bid _
Type 7 Top — %' $ 59.00 No Bid
12.5mm J— $5800 No Bid
9.5mm $ 60.00 No Bid o
Type 5 Shim $ 75.00 No Bid
ALL HMA PRICES WILL BE ADJUSTMENT BASED
ADJUSTED MONTHLY - 917 @$42000 | UPONNYSDOT INDEX

Terms: Net 30 Days
Thank you for the opportunity of presenting this quotation.
Sincerely,

AMENIA SAND & GRAVEL
DIVISION OF DOLOMITE PRODUCTS COMPANY, INC.

Jason ligner
Sales Representative

Asphalt/Sand & Gravel/Ready Mix Concrete Products



410 MNorth Avenue - PO Box 651

PECK HAMN Pleasant Valley, NY 12569

MATERIALS CORE. Tel: B45-535-2174 - Fax: 845-635-3726

whenw. peckham.com

September 6, 2017

Ms. Catherine Gill, Town Clerk
Town of Milan

20 Wilcox Circle

Milan, NY 12571

Dear Ms. Gill:

We submit for your consideration the following prices for road materials for the 2018 season.

CRUSHED STONE F.0.B. PER TON DELIVERED PER TON
V" Washed Crushed Stone $14.00 $20.50
#1 Washed Crushed Stone 13.75 20.25
#1ST Washed Crushed Stone 13.75 20.25
3/4” Washed Crushed Stone 13.50 20.00
#3 Crushed Stone 13.50 20.00
ltem 4 13.50 20.00
LSF (Light Stone Fill) 16.00 22.50
MSF (Medium Stone Fill 18.50 28.50
HSF {Heavy Stone Fill) 18.50 28.50
Abrasive Sand 14.00 20.50
BITUMINOUS CONCRETE EO.B PERTON

Type 1 Base $60.00"

Type 3 Binder 60.00%

Type 6 Top 62.00*

Type 7 Top 64.50"

Cold Mix 85.00%

* The above bituminous concrete prices are based on the September 2017 NYSDOT index price of
$420.00 per ton. Price is subject to escalation/de-gscalation.

Respectfully submitted,

Asst. Secretary
KM/ds




Rock City Sand & Gravel, Inc.
820 Route 199
Milan, NY 12571
(845) 758-1100

Sand - Stone - Fill - Gravel- Blacktop Estimates

September 13, 2017

Town ol Milan

Rl Bads

Sand $13.00/vd. F.O.B.
Gravel Item #4 $13.00 /vd. F.O.B

Tatlings $10.00/ yd. F.O.B,
I % * stone $15.00/ yd./ F.O.B,

Respectfully Submitted,

Roeco Mancim Jr.
@07’%% &



A. COLARUSSO & SON, INC.
Crushed Stone - Sand & Gravel - Blacktop
PO Box 302, Hudson, NY 12534
Phone; (518) 828-3218 Fax: (518) 828-0546

QUOTATION

To: Town Clerk, Town of Milan Project Highway Materials 2018

Town Hall Bituminous Concrete

20 Wilcox Circle

Milan, NY 12571 Location: FOB Plant
At Mr. Glen Butler
Phaone: 845-758-5164 Quote Date:  September 14, 2017
Cell:
Fax: B845-758-5831 Bid Date: September 15, 2017
E-mail

Product
Item Description Code FOB Unit Source

Hot Mix Asphalt | Type 1 Base MBABC $52.50 | Ton Mewman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt | Type 3 Binder 03BABC $54.60 | Ton Mewman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5mm Top (1/2") 1245.A.B $57.95 | Ton Mewman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt | Type 6 Top 06B,AB $58.80 | Ton Newman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt | Type 7 Armor Coat 07B.A B $6215 | Ton Newman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt | 9.5mm Top (1/2") 9545 A B $59.20 | Ton Newman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Top (1/4") 0045 4 B $61.75 | Ton Newman Rd. Hudson
Hot Mix Asphalt | Shim 058 §64.25 | Ten MNewrnan Rd. Hudson
Cold Mix Winter Mix 328 $80.00 | Ton MNewman Rd. Hudson

Hot Mix Prices ara based on current NYS DOT posted price index for asphatt. All increases in the cost of asphalt from the tima of the

quotation will result in a price increase ta the above quoted items. September 2017 posted price index for liquid asphalt $420.00 Per
Tan.

Payment Terms. Net 30 days, finance charges of 2 % per month (24% per year) will be applied to the unpaid balance after 30 days.
Payment not conditioned upon payment by third party. Any and all costs of collections, including attorneys fees will be addad if legal
action is necessary,

accepted: Thank ¥You,
ETBSAT

{ J.B<Heffner, Mie; resident of Operations

return with signature date



A. COLARUSSO & SON, INC.
Crushed Stone - Sand & Gravel - Blacktop

PO Box 302, Hudson, NY 12534

Phone: (518) §28-3218

Fax: {518) B28-0546

QUOTATION

To: Town Clerk, Town of Milan Project: Highway Materials 2018

Taown Hall Agaregates

20 Wilcox Circle

Milan, NY 12571 Location:
Attn: Mr. Glen Butier
Phone: 845-758-5164 Quote Date: Septembar 14, 2017
Cell
Fax; 845-758-5831 Bid Date: Saeptember 15, 2017
E-mail

Product Delivered by
Iterm Description Code Unit FOB Trailer | Triaxle Source

Crushed Stone [#14 (1/4"} Washed 01w Ton | §12.00 $16.10 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [#1 (1/2"} Washed 02wy Ton | §11.00 £17.10 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [#1A & #1 Mixed (1/4" & 1/2") Washad 05w Ton | 1150 51780 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stane [#2 (3/4") 03 Ton | $1075 $16.85 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [#1 & #2 Mixed (1/2" & 3/4") 23] Ton | $11.00 $17.10 Mewman Rd. Hudson
Crughed Stone |# 3 (1 15") 04 Ton | $11.00 $17.10 Nawman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stene [#4 {2"-3") 07 Ton | $11.00 $17.10 Mewman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone |Screenings (Stone Dust) 14 Ton 8855 $14 65 Mewman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone |Screen Fill (1" minus) 10 Ton §8.55 $14.85 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [ltem 4 (2" minus) Crusher Run 03 Ton 5940 $15.50 Mewman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [Heavy Stane Fill 15 Ton | $14.00 $2385 Mewman Rd, Hudson
Crushed Stone |Medium Stone Fill 14 Ton | $14.00 $23.685 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone |Gabion (Light Stane Fill) 13 Ton | $11.00 517 .50 Newman Rd. Hudson
Crushed Stone [Surge 12" Minus (Fine Stone Fill) 12 Ton | $10.75 $17.25 Mewman Rd. Hudson
Gravel Snow Sand - Washed S5W Ton $7.85 $14.05 CR-31 Hudson
Gravel Bank Run Gravel BR Ton $6.50 $12.80 CR-31 Hudson

Payment Terms: Net 30 days. finance charges of 2 % per month (24% per year) witl be applied to the unpaid balance sfter 30 days. Payment not
conditioned upon payment by therd party. Any and &l costs of collections, including atioreys faes will ba added if legal action is necessary.

accepted:

retum with signature date

Thank You,
_}--'\.;__)
W/ aTaY

I __J.B._,-Héﬂne'r.“‘vﬁbe President of Operations

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Campisi to give the bids to the
Highway Superintendent for his review and recommendation. Roll was taken and

carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

MINUTES: Regular Town Board Meeting —08/21/2017 — MOTION by Supervisor
Gallagher seconded by Council. Raelson to accept these minutes as written. Roll was

taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0




Ms. Meredith Tiedemann, Senior Vice President and Trust Officer from the Bank of
Millbrook gave a brief presentation on the Irene Wilcox Trust. She reviewed the
Account Synopsis and the Portfolio Summary. She said the beginning market value as
of January 1, 2017 was $563,391.23 and the ending value as of August 31, 2017 was
$602,098.52.

HIGHWAY SHED

The Supervisor informed the town board that the new highway building was complete
and has received the CO from Steve Cole, the building inspector.

SHARED SERVICES

The Supervisor said that the grant money the town received for recreation will be
shared with the Town of Pleasant Valley. He said that he contacted the Supervisor and
they discussed how they will share the services (dirt for ball field and striping).

COMMUNITY DAY

The Supervisor announced that Community Day will be held on Saturday, September
30, 2017 from Noon until 4 PM. We will hand out a beautification award for the
following homes: Jon Crafton and Francisco Pujol from Shookville Road, Brandon Cole
from Old Mill Road, and Verna DuBois from Salisbury Turnpike.

He also announced the Citizen of the Year, Rocco Mancini. The Supervisor said that Mr.
Mancini has lived in Milan since 1960 has been three (3) term Milan Fire Chief.
Currently he is the chairman of the ZBA and Community Day and Memorial Day
organizer. He said that “Rocky has consistently stepped up with unparalleled
leadership qualities.”

Resolution # 6 of 2017 — Amend Fee Schedule Section A208-4.C

Resolution offered by Council. Campisi seconded by Council. Raelson to amend Fee
Schedule Section A208-4.C as follows:

Delete in its entirety Section A208-4.C.(4), re-number, and

Under A208-4.B, add the following:

(23) Escrow accounts required.

(a) At the time of submission of any application, or thereafter, an escrow account shall
be established from which withdrawals shall be made to reimburse the Town for the

costs of consultant services.

The applicant shall then provide funds to the Town for deposit into such account in an

amount to be determined as follows:

(1) Subdivision Applications: $300 for each new residential lot
or principal dwelling



ite Plan Review: Greater o or 0.1% of estimated project cost
(2) Site Plan Review: G £$500 or 0.1% of esti d proj

(3) Special Use Permit — Residential $550

(4) Special Use Permit — Commercial with $1,000
Estimated project cost $500,000 or less

(5) Special Use Permit — Commercial with $2,000
Estimated project cost over $500,000

(6) Special Use Permit — Demolition $550
(7) Area/Use Variance S500 or greater amount as

determined by the ZBA at
time

of application or thereafter
(8) Petition for Rezoning $1,000 or such greater
amount

determined by the Town
Board

at time of application or
thereafter
(9) SEQRA Compliance requiring 0.5% of estimated project
cost, not

including retention of
experts or

other such amount as
determined

by the Planning Board
(10) Building Department Performance $2,500
Escrow

(b) Escrow accounts shall be replenished from time to time as specified in the signed
escrow agreement between the applicant and the board.

Roll was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

Justice Christensen /Conference Training

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Campisi to reject Justice
Christensen’s request for funds to attend the annual conference of the New York State
Magistrates Association to be held at the Turning Stone Casino. Discussion followed.
Council. Campisi referred to the Reorganization Meeting of January where the town
board stated that the town would not pay for conference. Roll was taken and carried
YES-0

NO - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher



Resolution # 7 of 2017 Vosburgh Open Development Area (ODA)

Resolution offered by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Campisi to
approve the application for the establishment of an Open Development Area (ODA) for
the Vosburgh two (2) lot subdivision under NY Town Law Section 280.a Roll was taken
and carried
YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher
NO-0

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Campisi to hold a Special Town
Board meeting at the Milan Town Hall on October 4, 2017 at 10:30 am at the Milan
Town Hall to receive the Supervisor’s Town of Milan’s Tentative Budget for 2018. Roll
was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

Bluescope Retainage

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Raelson to authorize the
Supervisor to release the retainage of $43, 754.20 to Bluescope Construction upon
receipt of a certificate of occupancy on the highway utility building. Roll was taken and
carried

Roll was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

The Supervisor informed the board that he was meeting with the state at the transfer
station regarding the solar panels at 10:00 am on Wednesday. He said that if anyone
from the board is welcome to come and participate.

PUBLIC COMMENT

A couple from Academy Hill Road addressed the Town Board concerning the lack of cell
phone service and internet service. Council. Raelson said that he had a conversation
with Dan Ahouse from Altice who informed him that the town should have cable
service by the end of 2018. Council. Mathison interjected saying that they should
contact the Public Service Commission and they should also contact Dan Ahouse.
Council. Campisi said that they should petition the board asking the them to contact
the Public Service Commission regarding cable service in the town.

TRANSFER

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Campisi to transfer $5,000 from
9010.8 (State Retirement) to 5132.4 (Garage). Roll was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0



BILLS: The bills were presented to the board for their audit and review. MOTION by
Council. Campisi seconded by Supervisor Gallagher to pay General Abstract # 9 Claims
369 thru 408, totaling $24,309.83 and Highway Abstract # 9 Claims 122 thru 141
totaling $39,297.32. Roll was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

MOTION by Supervisor Gallagher seconded by Council. Mathison to adjourn this
meeting.

(8:03PM). Roll was taken and carried

YES - 5 Campisi, Godfrey, Mathison, Raelson, Gallagher

NO-0

Respectfully submitted,

Catherine Gill, Town Clerk



